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Set during the Great Depression, The Grapes of Wrath tells the powerful story of the Joad family's trek from
the dust bowl of Oklahoma to the promise of a new life in California. But what they find threatens to rip
apart their lives, and sever the ties that bind them together. A heart-wrenching full-cast adaptation of the
Pulitzer Prize-winning novel by John Steinbeck and a 1990 Tony Award® Winner for Best Play, Frank
Galati's play finds its timeless heart in the generous spirit of the common man.

An L.A. Theatre Works full cast performance featuring:

Shirley Knight as Ma Joad

Jeffrey Donovan as Tom Joad

Emily Bergl as Rose of Sharon

Michael Buie as Connie/Others

Daniel Chacón as Al Joad

Maurice Chasse as Deputy Sheriff/Others

Shannon Cochran as Mrs. Wainwright/Elizabeth Sandry

Trista Delamere as 2nd Narrator/Al’s Girl

Francis Guinan as Jim Casy

Charlie Matthes as Willy/Gas Station Attendant/Hooper Ranch Guard

Rod McLachlan as Uncle John

Robert Pescovitz as Pa Joad

Joel Rafael as Car Salesman/Man with Guitar



Stephen Ramsey as 1st Narrator/Others

Nicholas Sadler as Agricultural Officer/Others

Andy Taylor as Gas Station Owner/Floyd Knowles/Camp Director/Others

Todd Waring as Hooper Ranch Bookkeeper/Others

Fredd Wayne as Grampa/Mayor of Hooverville/Camp Guard

Michael Weston as Noah Joad/Others

Kate Williamson as Gramma/Others

Live music performed by the Joel Rafael Band. Adapted by Frank Galati. Directed by Richard Masur.

Recorded before a live audience.
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From reader reviews:

Lori Suda:

The book The Grapes of Wrath make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable
far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem using
your subject. If you can make reading through a book The Grapes of Wrath for being your habit, you can get
considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all
subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a publication The Grapes of Wrath.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you
think about this e-book?

Lisa Walker:

This The Grapes of Wrath book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands.
The benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This kind of The Grapes of
Wrath without we recognize teach the one who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't
become worry The Grapes of Wrath can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This The
Grapes of Wrath having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Robert Cox:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot
of new information. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you
actually more imaginative. When you studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you
to imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some
others. When you read this The Grapes of Wrath, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon
about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Anthony Carter:

The reason why? Because this The Grapes of Wrath is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside. Reading this book beside it was
fantastic author who have write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of positive aspects
than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking way. So ,
still want to hold up having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.
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