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"Let’s face it. The Bible can be puzzling. Questions will often come to mind while you’re reading it. The
NIV Quest Study Bible anticipates these questions and gives you various interpretations by today’s most
trusted scholars. It addresses the common, uncommon, and sometimes perplexing questions people have
about Scripture. The notes were formed by asking 1,000 readers for the questions that came to mind as they
read the Bible. So you can be sure that the topics addressed in this Bible will be relevant to you.

The NIV Quest Study Bible answers over 7,000 questions about the Bible and includes nearly 350 articles by
trusted scholars that address provocative questions relevant to today. You’ll also find an expanded subject
index, a concordance, and a 16-page full-color map section. Passages that were once confusing will become
clear with the insights of the NIV Quest Study Bible.

This edition includes engaging tools like:
• Over 7,000 notes to clarify puzzling passages • Nearly 350 articles by top scholars • Book introductions •
Article index and expanded subject index to help you quickly find the answers you’re looking for • Single-
column Scripture text format • Color-keyed verse numbers for instant reference to articles and sidebar notes •
Over 150 two-color in-text charts, timelines, and maps • Reading plans • Concordance • 16-page full-color
map section • Reading plans

Find the answers to your Bible questions with the NIV Quest Study Bible. Order your copy today.

This Bible offers supplemental information on the following topics: Aids, Abortion, Abuse, Abyss,
Addiction, Adultery, Alcohol Use, Angels, Armageddon, Celibacy, Choice, Covenant, Creation, Credit
Cards, Cults, Concubines, Forced Labor, Dancing, Decision Making, Discrimination, Disrespect, Divorce,
Temptation, Guidance, God’s Silence, Greed, Guardians, Homosexuality, Lawsuits, Leadership, Luck,
Choosing a Spouse, Mental Illness, Mystery, Natural Disasters, Nightmares, Nudity, Occult, Perfection,
Politics, Polygamy, Racism, Rape, Remarriage, Revival, Self, Submission, Suicide, Worship"
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From reader reviews:

Carla Ramirez:

Here thing why this specific NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The
Question and Answer Bible are different and trusted to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good
however it depends in the content from it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. NIV, Quest
Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible giving you
information deeper as different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no reserve that similar
with NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible.
It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the
world which is probably can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in playground,
café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted
book maybe the form of NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question
and Answer Bible in e-book can be your alternative.

Christopher Levi:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal
Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible is simple to deliver you can read it in the
park your car, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular
printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save typically the book
in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Erin Harmon:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes reading,
not only science book but additionally novel and NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather,
Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible or maybe others sources were given knowledge for you. After
you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher
or students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside
science publication, any other book likes NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather,
Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of
book like here.

Jeremy Turner:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book NIV, Quest Study Bible,
Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question and Answer Bible to make your personal reading
is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading ability is developing when you similar to reading. Try to



choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the impression about book and
looking at especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and go through it. Beside that
the publication NIV, Quest Study Bible, Personal Size, Imitation Leather, Gray/Pink: The Question and
Answer Bible can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're
doing of that time.
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