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Ben Kincaid falls in with a gang of eco-terrorists, and joins their fight against corrupt loggers

The trouble all begins when Ben Kincaid meets Margery. Kincaid is a lawyer on a book tour, at a poorly
attended signing in Washington state, and she is the bookseller’s cat. When he learns that the perfectly
healthy cat is to be euthanized, Kincaid breaks into the bookstore, planning a rescue. Instead, he lands
himself in jail, where he learns of a non-feline who’s facing the death penalty as well.
 
George Zakin is the head of a radical environmentalist organization called Green Rage. Six years earlier,
Kincaid got him acquitted on charges of breaking and entering, and now Zakin needs his help again. He has
been accused of planting a bomb that killed a lumberjack, and Kincaid will do whatever he can to save the
environmentalist’s neck—if he can get himself out of jail first.
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From reader reviews:

Karla Whisenant:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled Dark Justice (Ben Kincaid series Book 8). Try to face the book
Dark Justice (Ben Kincaid series Book 8) as your friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you
feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you
personally. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So ,
let's make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Minerva Gagliano:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Dark Justice
(Ben Kincaid series Book 8)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time together with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you
have additional opinion?

Tiara Arnold:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Dark Justice (Ben Kincaid series
Book 8) book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred %
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Carol McElroy:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this Dark Justice (Ben
Kincaid series Book 8), you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.
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