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The go-to guide to acing the Series 99 Exam! Passing the Operations Professional Qualification Exam
(Series 99) qualifies an individual to perform a variety of operations functions in support of a broker-dealer.
The exam covers the broker-dealer business at a fundamental level, standard operations functions, investor
protection and market integrity regulations, identifying and escalating regulatory red-flag issues to the
appropriate person in a firm, and professional conduct and ethical standards. There are no prerequisites for
the Series 99 Exam, but all candidates must be sponsored by a FINRA member firm. Created by the experts
at The Securities Institute of America, Inc., Wiley Series 99 Exam Review 2013 arms you with everything
you need to pass this challenging 100-question test. Designed tohelp you build and fine-tune your knowledge
of all areas covered in the exam and to guarantee thatyou're prepared mentally and strategically to take the
test, it provides: Dozens of examples Assorted practice questions for each subject area covered in the exam
Priceless test-taking tips and strategies Helpful hints on how to study for the test, manage stress, and stay
focused Wiley Series 99 Exam Review 2013 is your ticket to passing the Series 99 test on the first try--with
flying colors! Visit www.wileysecuritieslicensing.com for more information. The Securities Institute of
America, Inc. helps thousands of securities and insurance professionals build successful careers in the
financial services industry every year. Our securities training options include: Onsite classes Private tutoring
Classroom training Interactive online video training classes State-of-the-art exam preparation software
Printed textbooks Real-time tracking and reporting for managers and training directors As a result, you can
choose a securities training solution that matches your skill level, learning style, and schedule. Regardless of
the format you choose, you can be sure that our securities training courses are relevant, tested, and designed
to help you succeed. It is the experience of our instructors and the quality of our materials that make our
courses requested by name at some of the largest financial services firms in the world. To contact The
Securities Institute of America, visit us on the web at www.SecuritiesCE.com or call 877-218-1776.
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From reader reviews:

Adrienne McGinnis:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed
Wiley Series 99 Exam Review 2013 + Test Bank: The Operations Professional Qualification Examination?
Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time along with
your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Mary Fleming:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Wiley Series 99 Exam Review
2013 + Test Bank: The Operations Professional Qualification Examination. All type of book could you see
on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Calvin Williams:

The publication with title Wiley Series 99 Exam Review 2013 + Test Bank: The Operations Professional
Qualification Examination posesses a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after
read this book. This specific book exist new information the information that exist in this reserve represented
the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This
specific book will bring you inside new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on your
smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Jackie Peters:

You can obtain this Wiley Series 99 Exam Review 2013 + Test Bank: The Operations Professional
Qualification Examination by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve
trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply
written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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