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Provides state-of-the-art algorithms for sound capture, processing and enhancement

"Sound Capture and Processing: Practical Approaches" covers the digital signal processing algorithms and
devices for capturing sounds, mostly human speech. It explores the devices and technologies used to capture,
enhance and process sound for the needs of communication and speech recognition in modern computers and
communication devices. This book gives a comprehensive introduction to basic acoustics and microphones,
with coverage of algorithms for noise reduction, acoustic echo cancellation, dereverberation and microphone
arrays; charting the progress of such technologies from their evolution to present day standard.

Sound Capture and Processing: Practical Approaches Brings together the state-of-the-art algorithms for
sound capture, processing and enhancement in one easily accessible volume Provides invaluable
implementation techniques required to process algorithms for real life applications and devices Covers a
number of advanced sound processing techniques, such as multichannel acoustic echo cancellation,
dereverberation and source separation Generously illustrated with figures and charts to demonstrate how
sound capture and audio processing systems work An accompanying website containing Matlab code to
illustrate the algorithms

This invaluable guide will provide audio, R&D and software engineers in the industry of building systems or
computer peripherals for speech enhancement with a comprehensive overview of the technologies, devices
and algorithms required for modern computers and communication devices. Graduate students studying
electrical engineering and computer science, and researchers in multimedia, cell-phones, interactive systems
and acousticians will also benefit from this book.
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From reader reviews:

Yvonne Terrell:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read
one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Sound Capture and
Processing: Practical Approaches is kind of book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Caleb Hutto:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how
the figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this Sound
Capture and Processing: Practical Approaches, you could tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Beverly McClendon:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Sound Capture and Processing: Practical Approaches why
because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you actually. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
guide you to pick up this book.

Jeremy Bedford:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and soon. The Sound Capture
and Processing: Practical Approaches offer you a new experience in reading through a book.
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