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She's the practical one, who always does the right thing, even if that keeps her indoors.

He follows his own path, wherever nature leads him.

When Alissa moves to a cabin in the middle of nowhere, she thinks she's about to start her life over. Peace
and quiet with a sweet job at a coffee shop.

She even has a roommate named Brandon. He’s a little bit strange. He goes out all night and doesn’t return
until dawn. He eats large amounts of fish. But he’s rugged and handsome in that nature man kind of way.

But something is wrong with her roommate. He’s distant. He’s troubled. He’s naked or half naked all the
time. And there’s someone or something new in his life that he’s not telling her about.

After a suspenseful all-nighter, Brandon and Alisa share more than just conversation. They share a night
together, but can they share more than that? Is Alissa his fated mate, or is she bearly a roommate?

This 21000 word novella is a stand alone story with a HEA. It is part of the Bearly Series.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Vancleave:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter Paranormal Romance
Novella ) book is readable through you who hate the straight word style. You will find the details here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to
give to you. The writer involving Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter Paranormal Romance Novella )
content conveys the thought easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the content but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear
Shifter Paranormal Romance Novella ) is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Linda Carroll:

You may get this Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter Paranormal Romance Novella ) by browse the
bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy
this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose proper ways
for you.

Carlos McNerney:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter
Paranormal Romance Novella ) was vibrant and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book
Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter Paranormal Romance Novella ) has many kinds or genre. Start
from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that
you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel
happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading in which.

James Scott:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something
by book. Different categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims
Bearly a Roommate ( A BBW Bear Shifter Paranormal Romance Novella ).
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