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This work explores the increasingly popular phenomenon of volunteer tourism in the Global South, paying
particular attention to the governmental rationalities and socio-economic conditions that valorise it as a noble
and necessary cultural practice.

Combining theoretical research with primary data gathered during volunteering programs in Guatemala and
Ghana, the author argues that although volunteer tourism may not trigger social change, provide meaningful
encounters with difference, or offer professional expertise, as the brochure discourse and the scholarly
literature on tourism and hospitality often promises, the formula remains a useful strategy for producing the
subjects and social relations neoliberalism requires. Vrasti suggests that the value of volunteer tourism
should not to be assessed in terms of the goods and services it delivers to the global poor, but in terms of how
well the practice disseminates entrepreneurial styles of feeling and action. Analysing the key effects of
volunteer tourism, it is demonstrated that far from being a selfless and history-less rescue act, volunteer
tourism is in fact a strategy of power that extends economic rationality, particularly its emphasis on
entrepreneurship and competition, to the realm of political subjectivity.

Volunteer Tourism in the Global South provides a unique and innovative analysis of the relationship between
the political and personal dimensions of volunteer tourism and will be of great interest to scholars and
students of international relations, cultural geography, tourism, and development studies.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Robertson:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading whatever
they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Volunteer Tourism in the Global South: Giving Back in Neoliberal Times
(Interventions).

Irma Kellner:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of many ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative. When you looking
at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Volunteer
Tourism in the Global South: Giving Back in Neoliberal Times (Interventions), you could tells your family,
friends and also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-
book.

John Hagen:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This book Volunteer Tourism in the Global South: Giving Back in Neoliberal
Times (Interventions) was filled concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about
your scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you
know how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like at this
point, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Everette Murray:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book and also novel and Volunteer Tourism in the Global South: Giving Back
in Neoliberal Times (Interventions) or perhaps others sources were given knowledge for you. After you
know how the great a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case,



beside science publication, any other book likes Volunteer Tourism in the Global South: Giving Back in
Neoliberal Times (Interventions) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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