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Fly Creek Cider Mill and Orchard is one of New York State's oldest working cider mills. Owned by authors
Brenda and Bill Michaels, the mill sits on the banks of Fly Creek near historic Cooperstown, where for more
than 150 years visitors have come to watch as apples are pressed into fresh cider.

Released to commemorate the 160th anniversary of the mill, The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook captures
the history of this treasured operation through stories, photography, and more than 100 apple- and cider-
based recipes.

These recipes range from sauces and drinks to breads and soups to starters and main courses. Each recipe has
been selected with the home cook in mind. Contributed by mill employees and friends, each dish has been
vetted by James Beard Award–winning cookbook author Judith Choate, who is a friend of the Michaels
family.

When Hosea Williams opened the mill in the mid-1800s, settlers from around the region abandoned making
labor-intensive, homemade cider in favor of milling their apples at Fly Creek. While waiting for the fruit to
be turned into cider, community members amused themselves by watching the newfangled machinery,
picnicking, and gossiping with friends and family—a scene not so different from the mill's workings today.

More than 175,000 people visit the mill each year to experience a time-honored tradition that expresses the
essence of another era. This book will appeal not only to home cooks in search of some nostalgic goodness
but also to those who are interested in the history of a resilient American enterprise and the farm-to-table
food movement.
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From reader reviews:

Ward Bishop:

This The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes are reliable for you who
want to be considered a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Fly Creek Cider Mill
Cookbook: More than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes can be on the list of great books you must have is
usually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you with information that probably will
shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever
your conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More
than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you
trial run of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Robert Eslinger:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of various ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make you more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this The Fly
Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes, you could tells your family, friends as
well as soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Donna Hubbard:

The guide with title The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes has lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new
era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Mark Johnson:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but novel and The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More than 100
Delicious Apple Recipes or maybe others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the
truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or students
especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside science
book, any other book likes The Fly Creek Cider Mill Cookbook: More than 100 Delicious Apple Recipes to
make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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