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Examining two overlapping aspects of the prison experience that, despite their central importance, have not
attracted the scholarly attention they deserve, this book assesses both the degree to which prisoners can
withstand the rigours of solitude and how they experience the passing of time. In particular, it looks at how
they deal with the potentially overwhelming prospect of a long, or even indefinite, period behind bars.

While the deleterious effects of penal isolation are well known, little systematic attention has been given to
the factors associated with surviving, and even triumphing over, prolonged exposure to solitary confinement.
Through a re-examination of the roles of silence and separation in penal policy, and by contrasting the
prisoner experience with that of individuals who have sought out institutional solitariness (for example as
members of certain religious orders), and others who have found themselves held in solitary confinement
although they committed no crime (such as hostages and some political prisoners), Prisoners, Solitude, and
Time seeks to assess the impact of long-term isolation and the rationality of such treatment. In doing so, it
aims to stimulate interest in a somewhat neglected aspect of the prisoner's psychological world.

The book focuses on an aspect of the prison experience - time, its meanderings, measures, and meanings -
that is seldom considered by academic commentators. Building upon prisoner narratives, academic critiques,
official publications, personal communications, field visits, administrative statistics, reports of campaigning
bodies, and other data, it presents a new framework for understanding the prison experience. The author
concludes with a series of reflections on hope, the search for meaning, posttraumatic growth, and the art of
living.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Ricker:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
you is you don't know which one you should start with. This Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon
Studies in Criminology) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book
serves what you want and wish in this era.

Sergio Kelley:

The book Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon Studies in Criminology) will bring you to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book to learn, this book very acceptable to you. The book Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon
Studies in Criminology) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web
site, so you can more readily to read the book.

James Thrasher:

The book untitled Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon Studies in Criminology) is the guide that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was
did a lot of exploration when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to your account is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon Studies in
Criminology) from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Mark Nixon:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Prisoners, Solitude, and Time (Clarendon Studies
in Criminology) was colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Prisoners, Solitude,
and Time (Clarendon Studies in Criminology) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore not
at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the
best book in your case and try to like reading that will.
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