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Distance learning has become very popular in recent years, making evident some of the problems inherent to
online classes as they are today. High attrition rates, driven in part by student isolation and low satisfaction,
have plagued online courses. For an online class to succeed, it must be built upon engaging media and
meaningful interaction.

Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching provides a reference for educators in virtual
classrooms and enumerates strategies to foster instructor engagement and support. Because co-construction
of information, opposed to rote memorization of disseminated facts, engages students and develops critical
thinking skills, online education must shift to reflect this. Drawing from learning theory, this publication
focuses on the ways educators can shape their online classes to best suit their students and leave them with
knowledge and course satisfaction. This book is recommended for researchers, developers, students of
education, administrators, and online educators in all subject areas.
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From reader reviews:

Marian Sheffield:

The book Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational Technologies
and Instructional Design) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then
must we leave the great thing like a book Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching
(Advances in Educational Technologies and Instructional Design)? Some of you have a different opinion
about guide. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give for each other; you can share
all of these. Book Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational
Technologies and Instructional Design) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Geraldine Carlson:

Often the book Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational
Technologies and Instructional Design) will bring you to the new experience of reading the book. The author
style to clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you.
The book Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational Technologies
and Instructional Design) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the
official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Stephen Medley:

This Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational Technologies and
Instructional Design) is brand new way for you who has fascination to look for some information since it
relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know otherwise
you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online
Teaching (Advances in Educational Technologies and Instructional Design) can be the light food to suit your
needs because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books
produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book web form. People who think
that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is no in reading
a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So ,
don't miss it! Just read this e-book kind for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Jon Fuselier:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So
you know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You have to know
that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to provide you



knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to
something by book. Amount types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this
Increasing Productivity and Efficiency in Online Teaching (Advances in Educational Technologies and
Instructional Design).
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