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Ronald Lockett (1965–1998) stands out among southern artists in the late twentieth century. Raised in the
African American industrial city of Bessemer, Alabama, Lockett explored a range of recurring themes
through his art: faith, the endless cycle of life, environmental degradation, historical events, the sweetness of
idealized love, mourning, human emotion, and personal struggle. By the time Lockett died at age thirty-two,
he had created an estimated four hundred works that document an extraordinary artistic evolution. This book
offers the first in-depth critical treatment of Lockett's art, alongside sixty full-color plates of the artist's
paintings and assemblages, shedding light on Lockett's career and work. By placing Lockett at its center,
contributors contextualize what might be best understood as the Birmingham-Bessemer School of art, which
includes Thornton Dial, Joe Minter, and Lonnie Holley, and its turbulent social, economic, and personal
contexts. While broadening our understanding of southern contemporary art, Fever Within uncovers how one
artist's work has become emblematic of the frustrated, yearning, unredeemed promises, and family and
community resilience expressed by a generation of African American artists at the close of the twentieth
century.

Contributors include Paul Arnett, Sharon Patricia Holland, Katherine L. Jentleson, Thomas J. Lax, and Colin
Rhodes.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Wiggins:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Fever Within: The Art of Ronald Lockett.

Darlene Johnson:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know what kind you should start with. This Fever Within: The Art of Ronald Lockett is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in
this era.

Billy Golden:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or playing video games
all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read some sort of book. It
is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every day to reading a
book. The book Fever Within: The Art of Ronald Lockett it is very good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to
develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Alisa Gordon:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is Fever Within: The Art of Ronald Lockett this publication consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the world has grown up.
The vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made
some research when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.
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