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Divided into four sections, Heathen is a unified collection of poetry satisfying both intellectual and
emotional appetites. The vocabulary, phrasing, and figurative lan- guage prove author R. Flowers Rivera to
be a master of technique. A few of the poems include "Black English" suggesting that they are universal in
their application.

The characters in Part I, Isle of Promethea, bring classical mythology, especially Homer's Iliad and Odyssey,
vividly to life through applications to modern life and a sense of being present. Part II, I Am Hephaestus,
consists of a single poem with the same title divided into twelve sections and continues its mythological
basis. In Part III, Doubt, there is more variety, suggested by epigraphs by authors as dif- ferent as James
Seamon Cotter, Jr, Gertrude Stein, and the author of the biblical book of John; personal and symbolic
romantic love is introduced in such poems as "Vivid," "Anniversary Apart," and "Stay" although the "you"
does not necessar- ily refer to a person. "Her," for example, describes a poet's pen as "a fickle lover" who
refuses to produce the magic words of poetry. Part IV, "Mustard Seed," is the most personal section as "a
conversation with myself." Here the author transforms the ordinary into provocative extraordinary
expression. Her love of the South, the simple act of ironing clothing on a hot summer day, driving a car,
braiding a child's hair, and observing a Muslim man praying at an airport are some of the subjects in this
final group. This is an extremely satisfying collection of poems that invite the reader to return to it again and
again.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Crew:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Heathen. Try to make book Heathen as your pal. It
means that it can to become your friend when you sense alone and beside that course make you smarter than
previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because
you can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience and also knowledge with this
book.

Ruth Ford:

This book untitled Heathen to be one of several books that best seller in this year, this is because when you
read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this book in the book shop or you
can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this
book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you personally to
past this publication from your list.

Michael Kendig:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer may be Heathen why because the great cover that make you
consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic
as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Sanjuanita Mecham:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that when they
get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Heathen to make your current reading is interesting.
Your current skill of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to
make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be very first
opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that the guide Heathen can to be your brand-new
friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.
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