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In our times, international travel and extended living arrangements abroad have become almost a normal
occurrence in the lives of many people, particularly the young and college educated. Many of these people,
often with little training, find themselves with the opportunity to teach the English language to foreign
students. After a short stint teaching EFL students in a foreign culture, once-confident English -language
teachers often realize that some teacher training would have been useful.
This readable and creative new book by Jerry Gebhard is a textbook for the untrained ESL/EFL teacher. It is
designed for use by self-motivated teachers who seek to maximize their potential as teachers and, in so
doing, enhance the learning of their students. This guide stresses the multifaceted nature of teaching the
English language to nonnative speakers and is based on the real experiences of teachers. It provides basic
information that ESL teachers should know before they start teaching, as well as ideas on how language
instructors can guide students in the skills of listening, conversation, reading, and writing.
Teaching English as a Foreign or Second Language is unique in that it emphasizes self-development as
central to being an ESL/EFL teacher. A variety of self-development tasks are included. Each chapter is
guided by a set of questions directly relevant to teaching, including advice on teaching problems. An
appendix provides addresses, phone numbers and information on professional second/foreign language-
teaching organizations, as well as a list of professional journals and publishing houses.
The author's practical and self-motivating philosophy is inviting to a wide audience: EFL teachers, teachers
of teachers, and those who have found themselves in a position for which their training is incomplete. It is an
excellent work for everyday use and will serve as a fine reference tool.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Redd:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Teaching English as a Foreign or Second
Language: A Teacher Self-development and Methodology Guide as your daily resource information.

Stacey Pinkston:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to pick book
like comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Teaching English as a
Foreign or Second Language: A Teacher Self-development and Methodology Guide that give your
enjoyment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world
can be said as the opportunity for people to know world much better then how they react when it comes to
the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice only for the geeky man or woman but for all of
you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit,
you are able to pick Teaching English as a Foreign or Second Language: A Teacher Self-development and
Methodology Guide become your own starter.

Irene Wang:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you personally is Teaching English as a Foreign or Second Language: A Teacher Self-
development and Methodology Guide this reserve consist a lot of the information with the condition of this
world now. That book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer
make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he makes this
book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Judith Bradshaw:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Teaching English as a Foreign
or Second Language: A Teacher Self-development and Methodology Guide can be the solution, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this



fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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