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Even though the "ATHENIA" was the first naval casualty of the Second World War, history made little note
of her being sunk by a German torpedo. Most of the stories surrounding that event became over-shadowed
by the horrendous unfolding events of the war. The story begins with two young women from vastly
different social and economic backgrounds who decide to leave England before the beginning of the Second
world War. This decision will result in the death of one of the young women and the beginning of a life of
deception by the other. While it was not her plan, the main character of this book did not hesitate to take
advantage of the unfortunate death of her traveling companion who died when the the torpedo struck the
passenger liner the "ATHENIA". This deliberate decision became the foundation for a life of deception that
required her future actions to be one cover-up after another, while trying to achieve a social status that far
exceeded her humble background. Without reservation, she uses people in her life of "deception" and is
never concerned about how or where they fall. Her mission is all about her self, however, life has a way of
creating events and situations that are beyond the control of those that think their plan is infallible. The
reader will see the true history of this period and feel the events in the life of Mary Ann Winslow as seen
through the eyes of an outside observer. The story flows back and forth between England and the "Gold
Coast of Connecticut", with a surprise ending that defines justice!
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Moffatt:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can know everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Passport to Deception will make you to be
smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think
which open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that?
Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Bernard Walker:

The guide with title Passport to Deception includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a
lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you within new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Mark Bock:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Passport to Deception, you may enjoy both. It is
excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its
mind hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Susan Negri:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This reserve Passport to Deception was filled with regards to science. Spend your
time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has distinct feel when they
reading the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the
modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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